
Hours: 
Monday - Thursday  

Noon - 6:00 PM 
Friday  

Noon - 5:00 PM 
Saturday  

9:00 AM - Noon 

Contact: 
Phone: 920-346-2350 
Email:  
director@brandonlibrary.net 
Website: 
www.brandonlibrary.net 
Facebook:  
“Brandon Library” 
Temp Location: 
107 E. Main St.— 
former Methodist Church 

EXCITING NEWS FROM THE LIBRARY:  
HELP US FURNISH THE FUTURE! 

Thanks to the incredible support of our community, we’re 
thrilled to share that construction on our newly renovated 
public library is nearly complete! This transformative  
project has been made possible by the dedication and 
generosity of our neighbors, donors, grants, and local 
partners—and now we’re entering the exciting final 
phase: furnishing the new space. 

As we look ahead to our grand reopening soon after  
construction projected to be done September 26, 2025, 
we’re launching a Furniture Campaign to help bring the 
library to life with comfortable seating, functional work-
spaces, inspiring children’s areas, and more. We want 
every visitor—from toddlers to teens to seniors—to feel 
welcomed, supported, and inspired the moment they 
walk through our doors. 

We’re especially excited to announce a $10,000  
matching challenge from longtime library supporters 
Harold and Grace Kurtz. Every dollar you donate to the  
furniture campaign will be matched dollar-for-dollar, 
doubling your impact and bringing us twice as close to 
our goal. 

This is your chance to help shape the future of our  
community hub. Whether you give $10 or $1,000, your 
contribution will help create a space where learning,  
connection, and creativity thrive. 

Stay tuned for more updates as we count down to  
opening day—and thank you for helping us turn our  
vision into reality! 

Donate today and double your impact! 

SUMMER READING  

PROGRAM EVENT: 

July 9 at 2PM at the Library’s Temp 

Location—Join us for an epic  

adventure as we screen the brand new 

Minecraft Movie! Whether you’re a 

fan of building, battling, or just love a 

good story, this is one movie you won’t 

want to miss. Free admission | All  

ages welcome | Snacks provided. 

July 23 at 2PM at Pillar&Vine Event 

Center— Step into the dome and  

explore the wonders of the universe in 

a Portable Planetarium! Discover 

constellations, planets, and galaxies in 

an immersive space adventure—all 

without leaving the ground. Perfect for 

all ages Free and open to the public. 

 

Be sure to fill out your reading tickets 

for awesome prizes. And get your  

Library passport stamped by visiting 

Winnefox libraries. 


